
Computer Printer Toner and Ink Supply Central Valley
School District 356

BID: 343-05-05-B   East 19307 Cataldo

  Spokane Valley, WA  99016

BID DUE BY:  August 1, 2005   (509) 228-5476

11:00 AM

Bid Tabulation

1 2 3 4 5 6 7

COMPANY NAME
Accurate Forms & 

Supplies
American Coated 

Products, Inc.
Best Computer 

Supplies Comptree Comp-U-Save Copiers Northwest CVR
BASE BID

1A. OEM Total  $                            41,309.52  No Bid  $                            40,377.24  No Bid  $                            42,382.99  $                            41,517.96  $                            39,005.52 
1B. Remanufactured  $14,905.98 (incomplete)  $                            22,965.47  $13,125.66 (incomplete) $19,840.33  No Bid  $                            23,321.91  $                            26,634.00 
1C. Credit for Empty Cargridges  No Bid  $                                 396.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                                 588.18 

DISCOUNT FOR UNLISTED 
CARTRIDGES OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   .

2A. HP  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .   N/A               45% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .  28% OFF                40% OFF  .
2B. EPSON  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .   N/A               45% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .  28% OFF                36% OFF  .
2C. CANON  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .   N/A               45% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .  28% OFF                32% OFF  .
2D. LEXMARK  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .   N/A               45% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .  28% OFF                29% OFF  .

SUBMITTALS
VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Yes No Yes Yes Yes No Yes

DEBARMENT / SUSPENSION 
CERTIFICATION Yes No Yes Yes Yes No Yes

TAX RATE 8.5% 8.5% 8.5% 8.5% 8.9% 8.5% 8.5%
SIGNED Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

DISKETTE ENCLOSED Yes No No Yes Yes Yes No
SPREADSHEET Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

CVSD NOTES
Remanufacturered bid 
incomplete.

Remanufacturered bid 
incomplete.

Remanufacturered bid 
incomplete.

Didn't submit Bid Proposal as 
required.

8 9 10 11 12 13 14

COMPANY NAME ECCO Recycles
Educational Marketing 

System e-Media Plus Ikon Office Solutions K12 Discount MCPc Northwest Computer
BASE BID

1A. OEM Total  No Bid  No Bid  $                            40,574.95  $                            39,803.84  $                            40,447.54  No Bid  $                            40,601.53 
1B. Remanufactured  $17,279.82 (incomplete)  $                            15,646.31  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $16,555.34 (incomplete) 
1C. Credit for Empty Cargridges  $                                 753.82  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid 

DISCOUNT FOR UNLISTED 
CARTRIDGES OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   .

2A. HP   N/A               50% OFF  .   N/A               0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  40% OFF                N/A  .  33% OFF                N/A  .  30% OFF                30% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .
2B. EPSON   N/A               75% OFF  .   N/A               0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  30% OFF                N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .  30% OFF                30% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .
2C. CANON   N/A               70% OFF  .   N/A               0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  34% OFF                N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .  30% OFF                30% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .
2D. LEXMARK   N/A               50% OFF  .   N/A               0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  27% OFF                N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .  30% OFF                30% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .

SUBMITTALS
VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

DEBARMENT / SUSPENSION 
CERTIFICATION Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

TAX RATE 8.9% 8.5% 8.5% 8.5% 8.5% 8.5% 8.3%
SIGNED Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

DISKETTE ENCLOSED Yes No No No No No Yes
SPREADSHEET Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes

CVSD NOTES

Expected annual cost of toner 
and ink at this award price per 
unit is $ 40,000. 

Offered 10 of the 80 required 
remanufactured prices.

No prices listed on Bid 
Proposal.  Spreadsheet 
attached with pricing but not 
signed.  1A. $41,649.98; 1B. 
$17,856.62.

Remanufacturered bid 
incomplete.

15 16 17 18 19

COMPANY NAME
Northwest Office 

Technologies
Pacific Northwest 

Business Products Quill Rapid Refil Ink The Tree House, Inc.
BASE BID

1A. OEM Total  No Bid  $                            45,951.38  No Bid  No Bid  $                            36,079.14 
1B. Remanufactured  $                            18,222.23  $                            21,595.89  No Bid  $                            22,120.48  No Bid 
1C. Credit for Empty Cargridges  $                              1,853.50  No Bid  No Bid  $                                 637.90  No Bid 

DISCOUNT FOR UNLISTED 
CARTRIDGES OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   . OEM               |      Remanufactured   .

2A. HP   N/A               50% OFF  .  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  0% OFF                0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .
2B. EPSON   N/A               50% OFF  .  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  0% OFF                0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .
2C. CANON   N/A               50% OFF  .  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  0% OFF                0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .
2D. LEXMARK   N/A               50% OFF  .  10% OFF                10% OFF  .  0% OFF                0% OFF  .  N/A                   N/A  .  N/A                   N/A  .

SUBMITTALS
VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

DEBARMENT / SUSPENSION 
CERTIFICATION Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

TAX RATE 8.5% 8.8% 8.5% 8.5% 8.5%
SIGNED Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

DISKETTE ENCLOSED Yes No No Yes No
SPREADSHEET Yes Yes Yes- No Bid Every Item Yes Yes

CVSD NOTES
Offered 10% discount in letter 
with free shipping.

            Awarded at the August 8, 2005 board meeting to Educational Marketing System.

3430505B Bid Tab - Final


